



EON Compensation Request for A.11-03-014 Mary Beth Brangan

**FILED**

Date	Issue	Hours
3/26/11	read and review PG&E application	Opt-Out 2
3/28/11	tel Sage discuss issue	SMPS 0.25
3/29/11	consult w/experts on SMPS	SMPS 4
4/7/11	conference call w/allies to strategize	Opt-Out 1.5
4/11/11	tel. Network to coordinate issues	RF Emission 0.5
4/22/11	research and review filings	Radio-Off 2
4/23/11	discuss approach w/expert, review PG&E docs, draft comments	Analog 10
4/24/11	write comments	Analog 6
4/24/11	write comments	RF Emission 2
4/25/11	write comments	Analog 9
5/6/11	Attend first PHC	Opt-Out 3
5/8/11	Review PG&E response	Radio-Off 1
5/8/11	Review discovery responses and Wilner Motion	Analog 1
5/17/11	Give feedback on discovery questions to Network	Costs 1
5/18/11	Review and feedback to Network re discovery questions	Analog 1
6/6/11	Discuss NOI with Network	Opt-Out 0.1
7/20/11	Strategize with K. Sandizell re Mari County and Fairfax	Community 0.5
7/25/11	Discuss strategy w/L.Bragman, Fairfax	Community 1
7/27/11	Attended second PHC	Opt-Out 3
7/28/11	tel to coordinate w/Network	SMPS 0.5
8/4/11	Discuss implications of Judge Yip-Kikugawa's ruling for further details	Analog 0.5
8/10/11	Review various motions	Analog 1
9/13/11	Prepare for workshop	Analog 1
9/14/11	Attend Workshop	Opt-Out 4
9/15/11	Coordinate w/Wilner	RF Emission 0.25
9/15/11	Discuss strategy w/Network	Costs 0.3
9/22/11	Review Cmmsnr. Peevey's Delay List guidelines	Opt-Out 0.4
12/6/11	Review docs filed since Sept	Opt-out 4
12/7/11	Read filings	Analog 2
12/8/11	Review filings	Opt-out 4
12/9/11	Review docs filed since Sept.	Analog 3
12/9/11	Coordinate w/Network re PD	Analog 0.25
12/11/11	Review docs	Analog 2
12/11/11	Draft comments	Analog 6
12/11/11	Review PD	Analog 2
12/12/11	write comments	Extension c 6
12/20/11	Review PG&E reply comments	Analog 2

Total 2011 hours: 88.05 88.05

Begin 2012

1/23/12	Discuss strategy w/Network	Analog 1
1/24/12	Review, give feedback on Network letter	Costs 0.6
1/25/12	Gathering community input on opt out options at meeting	Opt-Out 2
1/26/12	Emails re PD strategy	Analog 3
2/1/12	Attend CPUC meeting for vote on PD	Analog 2
2/3/12	Conference call w/allies re decision strategy	Costs 1.3
2/6/12	Tel w/Network re strategy	Costs 0.3
4/7/11	Review records and assemble data for compensation request 1/2 rate	Opt-Out *7
4/8/12	Compensation Request 1/2 rate	Analog *10.5

4/9/12 Compensation Request

1/2 rate Analog \*8

Rate per hour: \$200

Total 2012 I 10.2

Total hours: full rate 98.25

Total hours half rate: 25.5

Compensation @ Full Rate: 19650

Compensation @ Half Rate: 2550

TOTAL Compensation for Mary Beth Brangan: 22200



