

**A.12-01-008, et al. Green Tariff Shared Renewables
Clean Coalition Staff Hours**



FILED
7-15-16
01:53 PM

K. Sahm White

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
12/11/13	Locational Value	Discuss plan for SB 43 comments with policy team	0.5
12/17/13	Locational Value	Discuss SB 43 issues and testimony with Steph	1
12/31/13	Locational Value	Testimony outline	1
		Total for 2013	2.5

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
1/2/14	Locational Value	Testimony prep	3
1/8/14	Locational Value	Discuss testimony draft with staff	0.5
1/9/14	Locational Value	testimony draft	5.25
1/10/14	Locational Value	testimony final draft	4
1/25/14	Locational Value	cross prep call	0.5
1/27/14	Locational Value	cross exam prep with staff attorney	1.75
1/28/14	Locational Value	Prep for Cross-X by PG&E and TURN	3
1/29/14	Locational Value	Cross exam preparation	1.5
1/31/14	Locational Value	Cross exam prep	0.75
2/3/14	Locational Value	Prep for Cross-X by PG&E and TURN	1
2/4/14	Locational Value	Cross exam - On call & prep review	2.5
2/5/14	Locational Value	Cross exam preparation	1.5
2/19/14	Community Prox	Inter-party conf on PG&E ELCR proposal	3
2/19/14	Community Prox	review comments on PG&E ELCR	0.5
3/5/14	Community Prox	Review and discuss comments on PG&E ELR	0.75
4/2/14	Locational Value	Plan reply brief outline with staff	0.5
4/2/14	Locational Value	Discuss reply brief w Stephanie Wang	0.5
4/28/14	Locational Value	Review draft opening comments - SCE implementation proposal	1
12/18/14	Locational Value	comment draft and edit	1.5
		Total for 2014	33

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
1/12/15	Locational Value	outreach and discussion	0.5
1/14/15	Locational Value	staff meeting on positions	0.25
1/15/15	Locational Value	PD comment draft	3.25
1/20/15	Locational Value	comment review & edits	2.25
1/22/15	Locational Value	Party comment review, discuss for reply comment	1.5
1/25/15	Locational Value	reply comment review & edits	1.25
2/25/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on positions	0.5
3/3/15	Environ Justice	position development for comments	0.5
3/16/15	Environ Justice	review positions	1.5

4/20/15	Environ Justice	Joint Utility procurement advice letter	1.5
5/20/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on positions	0.5
6/3/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on CalEnviroscreen use of	0.5
7/14/15	Diverse Projects	PG&E GTSR RAM6 webinar	1
8/12/15	Environ Justice	staff discussion of Track A party comments	0.5
8/26/15	Environ Justice	staff discussion of Track A Reply comments options	0.5
10/14/15	Environ Justice	staff update from Oct 12 workshop	0.5
11/4/15	Diverse Projects	Discuss Track B opening comments internally	0.5
11/8/15	Diverse Projects	comment review & edits	2.25
11/11/15	Diverse Projects	staff meeting on positions	0.5
11/18/15	Diverse Projects	comment review & edits	1.5
12/3/15	Diverse Projects	Discuss Track B opening comments internally	0.5
12/15/15	Locational Value	Discuss Clean Coalition Track B workshop presentations	0.5
12/17/15	Locational Value	staff meeting on positions	0.5
12/30/15	Locational Value	Workshop Presentation coordination, plan & draft	3
Total for 2015			25.75

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
1/4/16	Locational Value	Workshop Presentation prep	4
1/5/16	Locational Value	Cost Effectiveness Workshop	3
4/13/16	Diverse Projects	Discuss PD with internal policy team	0.5
4/21/16	Diverse Projects	PD position dev	0.75
4/28/16	Diverse Projects	PD comment draft review and edit	1.5
4/29/16	Diverse Projects	Discuss comments on PD internally	1
Total for 2016			10.75

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
7/6/16	IComp	Icomp preparation	1
Total IComp for 2016			1

Stephanie Wang

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
12/11/13	Locational Value	Discuss plan for comments with policy team	0.5
12/13/13	Locational Value	Review testimony	1.25
12/17/13	Locational Value	discuss all issues with Sahn	1
12/17/13	Locational Value	Review testimony	0.5
12/18/13	Locational Value	Draft comments	1.5
12/19/13	Locational Value	Draft comments	4
12/19/13	Locational Value	Draft comments	2.5
12/20/13	Locational Value	Draft comments	1
Total for 2013			12.25

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
1/2/14	Locational Value	Work on testimony with Sahn White.	1.75
1/6/14	Community Prox	Draft testimony	0.75
1/8/14	Locational Value	Discuss testimony with Sahn	0.5
1/8/14	Community Prox	Draft testimony	1.5
1/9/14	Community Prox	Draft testimony	1.75
1/9/14	Environ Justice	Discuss EJ procurement with Sahn and Greg	1
1/10/14	Environ Justice	Draft testimony	5.25
1/10/14	Locational Value	Draft testimony	1.5
1/10/14	Community Prox	Draft testimony	1
2/28/14	Environ Justice	Emails with CBE and SELC to coordinate comments	0.5
3/1/14	Environ Justice	email with CBE and SELC about shared renewables business model	0.5
3/3/14	Environ Justice	emails with CEJA and SELC to coordinate comments	0.25
3/4/14	Environ Justice	discuss with SELC/CEJA comments	1.25
3/4/14	Community Prox	ask Molly Hoyt PG&E questions by email	0.25
3/4/14	Community Prox	draft comments on PG&E ELCR	2
3/5/14	Community Prox	discuss with policy team	0.25
3/6/14	Environ Justice	draft comments	3.25
3/6/14	Diverse Projects	draft comments	3
3/6/14	Diverse Projects	discuss input from BSR consumers, email BSR follow up	0.75
3/7/14	Environ Justice	edit comments, coordinate with SELC and CEJA	1.5
3/7/14	Diverse Projects	with big data centers	2.5
3/26/14	Environ Justice	SB 43 - coordination call with CBE	0.25
3/27/14	Environ Justice	get input on GTSR proposals from stakeholders	1
3/27/14	Environ Justice	Draft letter for Adobe to attach to CC brief	1.25
3/27/14	Environ Justice	Incorporate BSR edits to draft letter for Adobe to attach to CC brief	0.75
3/27/14	Environ Justice	Call with Corinna, BSR, to discuss next steps	0.5
4/2/14	Locational Value	Plan reply brief content with Sahn White	0.5
4/3/14	Locational Value	draft reply brief	0.5
4/7/14	Locational Value	SB 43 - reply brief	2.5

4/8/14	Environ Justice	SB 43 PG&E and SDG&E - draft reply brief	0.5
4/11/14	Environ Justice	Plan hearings and ex parte strategy with Linda Barrera at SELC	0.5
4/28/14	Locational Value	SCE - Draft opening brief	1.75
5/12/14	Environ Justice	with CEJA and SELC beforehand.	1.5
Total for 2014			42.5

Enrique Gallardo

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
12/4/14	Locational Value	Review Ruling re Renew Int Cost Adder	1
12/5/14	Locational Value	Discuss re Renew Int Cost Adder	0.25
12/9/14	Locational Value	Draft Comments re Renew Int Cost Adder	3
12/10/14	Locational Value	Discuss re Renew Int Cost Adder	0.5
12/15/14	Locational Value	Draft Comments re Renew Int Cost Adder	2.5
12/19/14	Locational Value	Rev Comments re Renew Int Cost Adder	2
Total for 2014			9.25
Date	Issue	Task	Hours
1/9/15	Locational Value	Discuss PD, Comments w Lead Team	0.25
1/9/15	Environ Justice	Discuss PD, Comments w Lead Team	0.25
1/9/15	Environ Justice	Workplan on EJ Issue	0.5
1/9/15	Locational Value	Draft Comments on PD re TACs	3.5
1/14/15	Locational Value	Discuss PD, Comm w Policy Team	0.25
1/14/15	Environ Justice	Discuss PD, Comm w Policy Team	0.25
1/15/15	Environ Justice	Research EJ, CalEnviroScreen	3.5
1/15/15	Environ Justice	Draft Comm re EJ component	3
1/16/15	Community Prox	Draft Comm re Proximity of Projects	2.25
1/16/15	Environ Justice	Draft Comm re EJ component	2.75
1/20/15	Locational Value	Review Comments on PD	1.5
1/21/15	Environ Justice	Review Comments on PD	1.5
1/22/15	Environ Justice	Draft Reply Comm re Race Ethnicity	1.75
1/22/15	Community Prox	Draft Reply Comm re Community Proximity	1.5
1/23/15	Locational Value	Draft Reply Comm re Locational Value	1.25
2/25/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on positions	0.5
Total for 2015			24.5

Katie Ramsey

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
4/29/16	Diverse Projects	Disucss comments on PD internally	1
5/3/16	Diverse Projects	Reading PD and comments; preparing reply comments	2
5/4/16	Diverse Projects	Reading PD and comments; preparing reply comments	3
5/4/16	Diverse Projects	Reading PD and comments; preparing reply comments and outline	2
5/6/16	Diverse Projects	Reviewing comments and drafting joint party outline (google doc)	2
5/9/2016	Diverse Projects	Reviewing draft comments	1.5
5/9/2016	Diverse Projects	Reviewing near-final draft comments	1.5
Total for 2016			13

Brian Korpics

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
4/15/15	Environ Justice	Read through advice letters and prepare for April 20 Workshop	2.25
4/16/15	Environ Justice	Read through past positions and prepare for April 20 Workshop	3.25
4/17/15	Environ Justice	EJ Working Group call on GTSR webinars	2
4/20/15	Environ Justice	Joint Procurement Implementation Advice Letter webinar	1.5
4/21/15	Diverse Projects	Read Scoping Ruling for Phase IV	0.5
4/21/15	Environ Justice	SDG&E Customer-Side and Marketing Implementation webinar	2
4/22/15	Environ Justice	SCE Customer-Side and Marketing Implementation webinar	3
4/23/15	Environ Justice	PG&E Customer-Side and Marketing Implementation webinar	3
5/1/15	Environ Justice	Call with IOUs and intervenors on CalEnviroScreen	1
5/12/15	Environ Justice	Call with intervenors on use of CalEnviroScreen	1
5/18/15	Environ Justice	Call with IOUs and intervenors on CalEnviroScreen	1.5
5/18/15	Environ Justice	Research legal issues surrounding use of CalEnviroScreen	1.25
5/20/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on positions	0.5
5/21/15	Environ Justice	Call with CEJA	1
5/28/15	Environ Justice	Call with IOUs and intervenors on CalEnviroScreen	1
5/29/15	Environ Justice	Call with intervenors on CalEnviroScreen	1
6/1/15	Environ Justice	CalEnviroScreen workshop	3
6/3/15	Environ Justice	staff meeting on CalEnviroscreen use of	0.5
6/5/15	Environ Justice	Edit CalEnviroScreen joint statement	1.75
6/8/15	Environ Justice	Call with IOUs on CalEnviroScreen	0.5
6/11/15	Environ Justice	Email coordination with intervenors	0.25
6/28/15	Environ Justice	Participate in GTSR workshop	3
8/12/15	Environ Justice	staff discussion of Track A party comments	0.5
8/25/15	Environ Justice	Review Track A opening comments	3.5
8/26/15	Environ Justice	Discuss Track A internally	0.5
8/26/15	Environ Justice	Draft Track A reply comments	2.75

Date	Issue	Task	Hours
7/5/16	Icomp	Draft intervenor compensation claim	5.5
7/8/16	Icomp	Draft intervenor compensation claim	2.75
7/11/16	Icomp	Draft intervenor compensation claim	4.75
7/15/16	Icomp	Finalize intervenor compensation claim	1.75
		Total IComp for 2016	14.75