



FILED
10-24-16
02:45 PM

Onki Kwan Timesheet

Date	Task	Issue	Hours
12/8/2014	PRA - Read rulemaking filed 11/6/14	# OIR	0.2
12/8/2014	PRA - Research legal issues in rulemaking	OIR Issues 1 and 2	3.1
12/9/2014	SETT - Draft opening comments	OIR Issues 1 and 2	7.7
	SETT - Review opening comments from all BHPCL attys,		
12/12/2014	edit and finalize	OIR Issues 1 and 2	2.5
		Total Hours 2014:	13.5
1/22/2015	PRA - Review opening comments	# OIR	1.5
3/3/2015	GH - Prehearing conference	# OIR	1
6/10/2015	PRA - Review and analyze City of San Bruno Letter	# OIR	0.1
8/17/2015	# - Review scoping memo and ruling dated 8/11/15	# SM	1.1
8/18/2015	# - Research and analyze scoping memo and ruling	# SM	4.7
8/19/2015	SETT - Draft comments on draft proposal	# SM	6.6
8/20/2015	SETT - Draft comments on draft proposal	# SM	3.3
8/21/2015	SETT - Draft comments on draft proposal	# SM	4.1
8/24/2015	SETT - Review draft comments	# SM	2
8/25/2015	SETT - Draft additional comments	# SM	2.1
8/27/2015	PRA - Research PRA	SM Issues 1, 5	0.4
8/31/2015	SETT - Edit comments on draft proposal	# SM	7.6
	SETT - Review Guy's comments and finalize opening		
9/3/2015	comments on draft proposal	# SM	2.7
	PRA - Review, analyze and take notes on other parties'		
9/23/2015	comments	# SM	4.2
	SETT - Discuss, review, and analyze Guy's and my		
9/24/2015	summary of parties' comments for reply comments	# SM	1
	PRA - Read Communications Industry Coalition's Proposed		
9/24/2015	Recommendation	# SM	0.2
9/24/2015	SETT - Research and draft reply comments	SM Issue 2	2.4
		Total Hours 2015	45
1/12/2016	GP - Review ruling scheduling workshop	# SM	0.1
1/26/2016	GP - Review Ruth Hendrick's motion for party status	# SM	0.1

1/29/2016	SETT - Review parties' documents for workshop	SM Issue 1	1.2
2/2/2016	SETT - d0606066 Matrix Workshop	SM Issue 1, 5	5
6/29/2016	SETT - Review and analyze Commission's proposed decision for comment	SM Issues 1-5	1.6
7/19/2016	SETT - Review and analyze opening comments on proposed decision	SM Issues 1-5	5.9
7/19/2016	SETT - Research legal issues raised by opening comments	SM Issues 1-5	0.8
7/20/2016	SETT - Draft reply comments	SM Issues 1-5	8.4
7/21/2016	SETT - Review, edit and finalize reply comments	SM Issues 1-5	2
8/2/2016	GP - Review motions for party status	# SM	0.1
8/2/2016	SETT - Review City of San Bruno reply comments	SM Issues 1-5	0.2
8/3/2016	SETT - review reply comments to proposed decision	SM Issues 1-5	0.5
		Total Hours 2016	25.9

Travel

3/3/2015	Travel to Prehearing Conference	N/A	0.5
		Total Hours 2015	0.5
1/12/2016	Travel to D0606066 workshop	N/A	0.5
		Total Hours 2016	0.5

Claim Preparation

3/23/2015	COMP - Review NOI, prepare certificate of service and file NOI	# OIR, # SM	1.5
		Total Hours 2015	1.5
8/30/2016	COMP - work on intervenor compensation claim	N/A	1
8/31/2016	COMP - work on timesheet	N/A	3
9/21/2016	COMP - work on intervenor compensation claim	N/A	4.3
9/22/2016	COMP - work on intervenor compensation claim	N/A	1.83
9/27/2016	COMP - work on intervenor compensation claim	N/A	3.1
		Total Hours 2016	13.23