

Attachment A



FILED

03-30-10

04:59 PM

3/30/2010
2:43 PM

Venskus & Associates, A Professional Law Corporation
Pre-bill Worksheet

Nickname Surfrider Foundation v. Cal Am | 8140
 Full Name
 In Ref To
 Fees Arrg. By billing value on each slip
 Expense Arrg. By billing value on each slip
 Tax Profile Exempt
 Round Fees 6 Minutes
 Last bill
 Last charge 3/30/2010
 Last payment Amount \$0.00

Date ID	Timekeeper Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
<u>Initials: EM</u>					
2/26/2009 10155	E. Moeller Legal Research Legal Research re CEQA requirements between DEIR and FEIR; draft portion of CPUC statement re same; email same to S. Venskus;	295.00	1.10	324.50	Billable
2/28/2009 10163	E. Moeller Legal Research Legal Research CEQA cases and codes re CEQA requirements relating to costs of project; draft memorandum re same; email to S. Venskus;	295.00	1.40	413.00	Billable
4/9/2009 10356	E. Moeller Legal Research Legal Research case law and CEQA treatise re requirements for DEIR to address baseline conditions, cumulative impacts and project description; draft comments on Cal Am DEIR; review DEIR and client comments on marine biology; review emails re same; draft comments; email same to S. Venskus;	295.00	5.70	1,681.50	Billable
4/9/2009 10361	E. Moeller Draft Draft comments on cumulative impact section; review section; legal research re case law on ratio theory and required analysis;	295.00	2.90	855.50	Billable
4/14/2009 10374	E. Moeller Review Review draft comments and email from S. venskus re same; draft and edit comments on DEIR; review biological resources section of DEIR; conf w/ law clerk re legal research; legal research re significant impact review; begin draft of GHG comments; review air quality section of DEIR; legal research re avoidable impacts;	295.00	6.30	1,858.50	Billable
4/14/2009 10376	E. Moeller Telephone Conference w/ S. Venskus and S. Corbin re draft comment preparation and strategy;	295.00	1.70	501.50	Billable
4/15/2009 10380	E. Moeller Draft Draft comments on the DEIR;	295.00	7.80	2,301.00	Billable
5/12/2009 10531	E. Moeller Draft Draft addendum to NOI; review email from ALJ and S. Venskus; review NOI; legal research CPUC decisions and rulings re procedure for NOI re economic interest; email addendum to S. Venskus with comments;	147.50	1.70	250.75	Billable

3/30/2010
2:43 PM

Venskus & Associates, A Professional Law Corporation
Pre-bill Worksheet

Surfrider Foundation v. Cal Am: (continued)

Date ID	Timekeeper Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total
5/12/2009 10524	E. Moeller Conference Conference with s. venskus re NOI amendment; draft same;	147.50	0.20	29.50	Billable
5/13/2009 10536	E. Moeller Prepare and File Statement to NOI; teleconf w/ S. Venskus re filing; instruct staff re service;	147.50	1.40	206.50	Billable
Total: EM			30.20		\$8,422.25
<u>Initials: SDV</u>					
2/26/2009 10134	S. Venskus Research online research of other substantial CPUC CEQA doc and formal proceedings for PHC Statement issues; review revised CPUC Rules of Practice & Procedure re: filing requirements; review Ruling with respect to filing and service requirements and review User Guide re: same; draft email to SC re: client statistics and factual information for PHC Statement; review revised CPUC CEQA guidelines	350.00	1.60	560.00	Billable
3/18/2009 10621	S. Venskus Analysis and evaluation of R&R to SC's case plan CEQA matrix	350.00	1.00	350.00	Billable
4/9/2009 10363	S. Venskus Research research CPUC website re: rulemaking on intervenor rate setting and rulemaking history; review previous NOI rulings; prior compensation awards;	175.00	2.60	455.00	Billable
4/9/2009 10362	S. Venskus Review Review and edit EIR comments	350.00	1.20	420.00	Billable
4/12/2009 10368	S. Venskus Draft draft NOI; review all experts' email responses to my requests for more information about their rates and level of experience also their cvs and previous CPUC decisions; read carefully each one of the CPUC's decisions with respect to hourly intervenor rates; review ALJ Scoping Ruling dated 3/26/09 for issues and timeline and also NOI requirements; review updated rules on intervenor compensation procedures (CPUC website); review prior NOI filed on behalf of Desal Response Group; review Surfrider 100 page bylaws	175.00	4.60	805.00	Billable
4/13/2009 10372	S. Venskus Review Review Surfrider's comments on DEIR	350.00	1.00	350.00	Billable
4/13/2009 10371	S. Venskus Draft Finish drafting NOI	175.00	2.80	490.00	Billable

3/30/2010
2:43 PM

Venskus & Associates, A Professional Law Corporation
Pre-bill Worksheet

Surfrider Foundation v. Cal Am: (continued)

Date ID	Timekeeper Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total Billable
4/14/2009 10377	S. Venskus Draft Draft DEIR - conference call with SC and EM re: comment clarification and substantial evidence	350.00	3.30	1,155.00	Billable
4/14/2009 10378	S. Venskus Analysis and evaluation of review and comment on Bob Curry's DEIR comment letter; draft email to him re: same	350.00	1.80	630.00	Billable
4/15/2009 10381	S. Venskus Draft Draft final DEIR comments	350.00	4.20	1,470.00	Billable
5/29/2009 10643	S. Venskus Review review ALJ ruling on NOI	175.00	0.20	35.00	Billable
12/21/2009 11853	S. Venskus Advise Request for Compensation - contact expert Curry for timesheets; discuss timeslips production for RFC with TH	175.00	0.20	35.00	Billable
1/12/2010 11992	S. Venskus Telephone Call call with Bob Curry re: time spent on EIR review and comments > Request for Compensation	175.00	0.10	17.50	Billable
2/11/2010 12102	S. Venskus Draft final edit to Request for Compensation on CEQA Proceeding	175.00	0.90	157.50	Billable
3/30/2010 12277	S. Venskus Review Edit and Review Amendment.	175.00	1.00	175.00	Billable
Total: SDV			26.50		\$7,105.00
<u>Initials: TL</u>					
11/16/2009 11810	T. Labriola Review Review structure of FEIR and initial review of responses to comments	295.00	1.50	442.50	Billable
11/17/2009 11861	T. Labriola Preparation Finished analysis of response to Surfrider's DEIR comments	295.00	6.00	1,770.00	Billable
12/16/2009 11860	T. Labriola Preparation Began Drafting Request for Compensation for comments on DEIR	147.50	3.10	457.25	Billable

3/30/2010
2:43 PM

Venskus & Associates, A Professional Law Corporation
Pre-bill Worksheet

Surfrider Foundation v. Cal Am: (continued)

Date ID	Timekeeper Task	Rate Markup %	Hours DNB Time	Amount DNB Amt	Total Billable
12/18/2009 11862	T. Labriola Preparation Finished draft of Request for Compensation for participation in CEQA proceeding	147.50	3.00	442.50	Billable
1/8/2010 12003	T. Labriola Email/Correspondence email to S Damron regarding bio for request for compensation	147.50	0.20	29.50	Billable
1/8/2010 12004	T. Labriola Email/Correspondence email to E Moeller regarding bio for request for compensation	147.50	0.20	29.50	Billable
1/14/2010 12031	T. Labriola Draft Draft biography for EM, TL, SD in the Request for compensation	147.50	1.20	177.00	Billable
1/21/2010 12069	T. Labriola Draft Complete bio's, hourly rates, and other procedural tasks in Compensation Claim	147.50	1.50	221.25	Billable
3/23/2010 12275	T. Labriola Research Research on amendment	147.50	0.20	29.50	Billable
3/30/2010 12276	T. Labriola Draft Draft amendment	147.50	1.00	147.50	Billable
Total: TL			17.90	\$3,746.50	
TOTAL Billable Fees			74.60	\$19,273.75	
Total of billable expense slips					\$0.00

Calculation of Fees and Costs

	Amount	Total
Fees Bill Arrangement: Slips By billing value on each slip.		
Total of billable time slips	\$19,273.75	
Total of Fees (Time Charges)		\$19,273.75
Total of Costs (Expense Charges)		\$0.00

3/30/2010
2:43 PM

Venskus & Associates, A Professional Law Corporation
Pre-bill Worksheet

Surfrider Foundation v. Cal Am: (continued)

	<u>Amount</u>	<u>Total</u>
Total new charges		\$19,273.75
New Balance Current	\$19,273.75	
Total New Balance		<u><u>\$19,273.75</u></u>