Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Melissa Kasnitz 2023 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
2/15/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Email exchange w/ SCE (JP Shotwell) re: proposal for joint testimony on accessibility issues for GRC and setting meeting re: same	0.5	\$715	\$357.50	FILED 11/29/1/25 11:57 AM
3/23/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Email exchange w/ JP Shotwell setting meeting re: joint testiomony	0.2	\$715	\$143.00	A2305010 Kasnitz
3/29/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Review draft joint testimony from SCE; notes re: same for discussion	1	\$715	\$715.00	Kasnitz
3/29/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Call w/ JP Shotwell & V. Fu re: joint testimony	1	\$715	\$715.00	Kasnitz
4/19/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Email exchange w/ JP Shotwell re: support for increase in cost of included services & review information provided re: same	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz
4/19/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Review revised draft joint testimony; notes re: same	0.6	\$715	\$429.00	Kasnitz
5/9/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Email exchange w/ JP Shotwell finalizing joint testimony on accessibility issues	0.4	\$715	\$286.00	Kasnitz
5/15/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Review Application including joint testimony	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz
7/12/23	SCE 2025 GRC	General Participation	Attend PHC	1.7	\$715	\$1,215.50	Kasnitz
9/5/23	SCE 2025 GRC	General Participation	Review Scoping Memo; notes re: same	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz

Totals 2023: 6.3 \$4,504.50

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Melissa Kasnitz 2024 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
3/27/24	SCE 2025 GRC	ACCESSIDIIIV	Review materials & summary of materials in advance of annual accessibility meeting	0.5	\$735	\$367.50	Kasnitz
3/28/24	SCE 2025 GRC	TACCACCIONIN	Attend annual meeting re: accessibility MOU achievements and priorities	1.0	\$735	\$735.00	Kasnitz
5/1/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review annual report summary	0.2	\$735	\$147.00	Kasnitz

Totals 2024: 1.7 \$1,249.50

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Melissa Kasnitz 2025 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
1/6/25	SCE 2025 GRC	General Participation	Review invitation to settlement discussions & reply to same	0.2	\$755	\$151.00	Kasnitz
4/8/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review compliance issues for SCE w/ K. Woodford in advance of meeting	0.5	\$755	\$377.50	Kasnitz
4/9/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Prep for meeting; review audit summaries & compliance materials	0.4	\$755	\$302.00	Kasnitz
4/9/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Attend annual meeting re: disability access	1.0	\$755	\$755.00	Kasnitz
4/9/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Email exchange w/ K. Woodford re: next steps following meeting	0.2	\$755	\$151.00	Kasnitz
5/29/25	SCE 2025 GRC	General Participation	Attend follow up to annual meeting	0.6	\$755	\$453.00	Kasnitz
7/28/25	SCE 2025 GRC	General Participation	Review selected elements of PD resolving SCE GRC Application; notes re: same	1.8	\$755	\$1,359.00	Kasnitz

Totals 2025: 4.7 \$3,548.50

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Kate Woodford 2023 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
2/15/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Email exchange w/ JP Shotwell to coordinate on testimony	0.2	\$280	\$56.00	Woodford
3/9/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Call w/ JP Shotwell to coordinate meeting re: testimony	0.2	\$280	\$56.00	Woodford
3/29/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Agreement	Attend call w/ M.Kasnitz & SCE re: joint testimony	1	\$280	\$280.00	Woodford
12/15/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Email exchange w/ SCE re: annual meeting	0.2	\$280	\$56.00	Woodford
			Totals 2023:	1.6		\$448.00	

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Kate Woodford 2024 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
1/16/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review materials for annual consultation meeting; prepare summary of same	1.0	\$290	\$290.00	Woodford
1/16/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Email exchange w/ SCE resetting annual meeting	0.2	\$290	\$58.00	Woodford
3/13/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review agenda & materials for annual meeting re: accessibility in advance of annual meeting	0.5	\$290	\$145.00	Woodford
3/28/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Attend Annual MOU call for Accessibility status w/ M Kasnitz	1.0	\$290	\$290.00	Woodford
4/29/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review 2023 annual report from S. Lee (SCE); prepare summary of same	1.0	\$290	\$290.00	Woodford
5/31/24	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review of SCE supplied MOU documents: notes re: same	1.0	\$290	\$290.00	Woodford

Totals 2024: 4.7 \$1,363.00

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Kate Woodford 2025 Merits Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
2/25/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Email exchange w/ SCE re: annual meeting	0.2	\$380	\$76.00	Woodford
3/24/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review audits re: APAs, pedestrian traffic control; draft summary of same in prep for MOU call	2.0	\$380	\$760.00	Woodford
4/7/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Document prep for accessibility call on 4/9/25	1.5	\$380	\$570.00	Woodford
4/8/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Meeting with SCE w/ M Kasnitz	0.5	\$380	\$190.00	Woodford
4/9/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Attend meeting w/ SCE to discuss C4AT's concerns on the inaccessible website, bad PTCM and APA audits	1.0	\$380	\$380.00	Woodford
4/9/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Email exchange w/ M. Kasnitz re: next steps for accessibility review.	0.2	\$380	\$76.00	Woodford
4/30/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Accessibility	Review 2024 Annual Report; draft summary of same	1.3	\$380	\$494.00	Woodford

Totals 2025: 6.7 \$2,546.00

Center for Accessible Technology SCE 2025 GRC A.23-05-010 Fee Time

Date	Project	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Totals	Name
8/9/23	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft NOI	1.0	\$357.50	\$357.50	Kasnitz
11/19/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft Compensation Request	2.5	\$175.00	\$437.50	Sweetnam
11/20/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft Compensation Request	2.2	\$175.00	\$385.00	Sweetnam
11/21/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft Compensation Request	1.0	\$175.00	\$175.00	Sweetnam
11/21/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft compensation request	1.0	\$377.50	\$377.50	Kasnitz
11/24/25	SCE 2025 GRC	Fees	Draft compensation request	0.5	\$377.50	\$188.75	Kasnitz

Total Fee Time: 8.2 \$1,921.25