

Center for Accessible Technology
 CASF R.20-08-021 Paul Goodman
 2023 Merits Time



Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
11/29/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Review Ruling Inviting Comment on Staff Proposals re: BPFA and TTAP & attached staff proposals take notes re: same.	0.9	\$575	\$517.50	Goodman 01/23/26
12/4/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Call w/ TURN, Cal Advocates re: Staff Proposals	0.4	\$575	\$230.00	Goodman 01-50pm
12/4/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Review TURN draft outline for comments.	0.2	\$575	\$115.00	Goodman R.2008b21
12/4/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Review TURN draft comparison of current BPFA rules to Staff Proposal	0.5	\$575	\$287.50	Goodman
12/4/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Call w/ R. Sweetnam re: comments on Staff Proposals	0.2	\$575	\$115.00	Goodman
12/5/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Draft Outline of Comments on BPFA	0.4	\$575	\$230.00	Goodman
12/6/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Meet with R. Sweetnam re: Comments on BPFA	0.3	\$575	\$172.50	Goodman
12/7/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Draft BPFA Opening Comments	2.3	\$575	\$1,322.50	Goodman
12/8/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Email exchange w/ M. Kasnitz, R. Sweetnam re: draft comments	0.2	\$575	\$115.00	Goodman
12/8/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Review and Draft Comments on BPFA	2.2	\$575	\$1,265.00	Goodman
12/12/23	CASF OIR	BPFA	Review Opening Comments of other parties; draft notes re: same.	1.1	\$575	\$632.50	Goodman
Totals 2023:				8.7		\$5,002.50	

Center for Accessible Technology
 CASF R.20-08-021 Paul Goodman
 2024 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/29/24	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review PD re: BPHA; take notes re: same.	0.5	\$625	\$312.50	Goodman
2/20/24	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review BPHA Revised Application Requirements and Guidelines (Attachment A to PD); take notes re: same.	1	\$625	\$625.00	Goodman
2/23/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Email exchange w/L. Fitzpatrick (TURN) re: draft reply comments	0.2	\$625	\$125.00	Goodman
3/22/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Email exchange w/TURN, Cal Advocates re: PFM	0.3	\$625	\$187.50	Goodman
3/26/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Draft feedback re: TURN PFM on end of federal ACP	0.8	\$625	\$500.00	Goodman
12/5/24	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Review Ruling inviting Comments on Staff Proposals and Staff Proposals for Modification to Line Extension Program, Adoption Account and Consortia Account; draft notes re: same.	1.3	\$625	\$812.50	Goodman
12/11/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Email to other parties re: extension of deadlines for filing comments and reply comments	0.3	\$625	\$187.50	Goodman
12/17/24	CASF OIR	Procedural	Email to ALJ re: request for extension of deadlines for filing comments and reply comments	0.3	\$625	\$187.50	Goodman
12/17/24	CASF OIR	Procedural	Review email ruling granting request for extension	0.1	\$625	\$62.50	Goodman
12/17/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Email to LA-DEAL regarding extension.	0.2	\$625	\$125.00	Goodman

Totals 2024: 5 **\$3,125.00**

Center for Accessible Technology
 CASF R.20-08-021 Paul Goodman
 2025 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Task	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/13/25	CASF OIR	Coordination	Email exchange with Unite LA, LA-DEAL, DELA re: process for requesting extension of time	0.4	\$680	\$272.00	Goodman
1/15/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Draft outline for comments on Ruling re: LEP, AA, CA.	0.5	\$680	\$340.00	Goodman
1/16/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Research re: digital literacy definition.	0.4	\$680	\$272.00	Goodman
1/29/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Draft Comments on Ruling	6.3	\$680	\$4,284.00	Goodman
1/30/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Call w/ LA DEAL re: comments	0.7	\$680	\$476.00	Goodman
9/26/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Review Comments on PD; draft notes re same.	1.5	\$680	\$1,020.00	Goodman
9/26/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Call w/M. Kasnitz re: PD	0.2	\$680	\$136.00	Goodman
11/12/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Call w/ Connect the Valley re: CASF issues.	1	\$680	\$680.00	Goodman
Totals 2025:				11		\$7,480.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
CASFR.20-08-021 Melissa W. Kasnitz
2023 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
12/8/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review and Draft BPHA Comments	0.4	\$715	\$286.00	Kasnitz
Totals 2023:						0.4	\$286.00

Center for Accessible Technology
CASFR.20-08-021 Melissa W. Kasnitz
2024 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
4/13/24	CASF OIR	Coordination	Draft feedback re: PFM on end of federal ACP	0.2	\$735	\$147.00	Kasnitz
Totals 2024:						0.2	\$147.00

Center for Accessible Technology
CASFR.20-08-021 Melissa W. Kasnitz
2025 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Category	Task	Hours	Rate	Total
2/12/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Review party opening comments on program proposals; notes re: same for potential reply comments	1.2	\$755	\$906.00
9/26/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Brief review of PD re: Broadband Adoption Account.	0.3	\$755	\$226.50
9/26/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Call w/P. Goodman re: PD	0.2	\$755	\$151.00
10/16/25	CASF OIR	LEP/BAA/BCA	Review & edit draft comments on PD	0.3	\$755	\$226.50
Totals 2025:				2		\$1,510.00

Center for Accessible Technology
 CASFR.20-08-021 Rachel Sweetnam
 2023 Merits Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total
12/4/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Meet with Paul re: comments on BPHA proposal	0.2	\$220	\$44.00
12/5/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Draft CforAT's opening comments on BPHA and Revisions to Staff Proposal	1	\$220	\$220.00
12/5/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review previous CforAT Comments on BPHA (from 5/26/2023)	0.2	\$220	\$44.00
12/6/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Meet with P. Goodman re: comments on BPHA	0.3	\$220	\$66.00
12/6/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review BPHA staff proposal	0.6	\$220	\$132.00
12/6/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Draft comments on BPHA (sections on equipment and free broadband service)	1.5	\$220	\$330.00
12/7/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review BPHA staff proposal	0.4	\$220	\$88.00
12/7/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Draft comments on BPHA (sections on equipment and free broadband service)	0.9	\$220	\$198.00
12/8/23	CASF OIR	BPHA	Review and Draft BPHA Comments	0.1	\$220	\$22.00
Totals 2023:				5.2		\$1,144.00

Center for Accessible Technology

CASFR.20-08-021

Fee Time

Date	Proceeding	Task	Notes	Time	Rate	Total	Name
1/13/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	1.6	\$137.50	\$220.00*	Sweetnam
1/14/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	0.2	\$137.50	\$27.50*	Sweetnam
1/15/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	0.5	\$137.50	\$68.75*	Sweetnam
1/16/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	0.4	\$137.50	\$55.00*	Sweetnam
1/20/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	2.5	\$137.50	\$343.75*	Sweetnam
1/21/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	2.8	\$137.50	\$385.00*	Sweetnam
1/22/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft comp request	4.3	\$137.50	\$591.25*	Sweetnam
Totals Sweetnam:				12.3		\$1,691.25	

1/21/26	CASF OIR	Fees	Draft IComp Request	2	\$340	\$680.00*	Goodman
Totals:				2		\$680.00	

Total Fee Time: **\$2,371.25**

* All of CforAT's claimed hours for 2026 are hours spent on drafting the compensation claim. Accordingly, we are using our 2025 rates for those hours. CforAT will request 2026 rates in another proceeding.