

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2020 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz



Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/16/2020	Affordability OIR	Study	Conf. w/ A. Slipski re: prep for PHC and recommendations for addressing essential usage study proposal	0.2	\$495	\$99.00	FILED R1807006 Kasnitz 03:56 PM
11/28/2020	Affordability OIR	Study	Review IOU request to extend deadline for status report re: web tool	0.2	\$495	\$99.00	R1807006 Kasnitz
12/18/2020	Affordability OIR	Study	Review status update on web tool for EUS	0.3	\$495	\$148.50	Kasnitz
Totals 2020:				0.7		\$346.50	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2021 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
2/23/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review Agenda & White Paper on utility rates and affordability in the future (in advance of 2/24 En Banc)	0.8	\$670	\$536.00	Kasnitz
2/24/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend CPUC en banc re: electric rates & costs	6	\$670	\$4,020.00	Kasnitz
6/22/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Review material on EUS & upcoming public meetings; email exchange w/ expert P. Kahn re: same	0.5	\$670	\$335.00	Kasnitz
6/25/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Call w/ P. Kahn re: upcoming public meetings re: EUS & potential improvements	0.5	\$670	\$335.00	Kasnitz
7/6/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Review notice re: 7/20 meeting; email exchange w/ P. Kahn re: same	0.2	\$670	\$134.00	Kasnitz
7/7/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Email exchange w/ expert P. Kahn re: introductory EUS meeting	0.2	\$670	\$134.00	Kasnitz
7/19/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Review material distributed in advance of planning session; email to P. Kahn re: same	0.5	\$670	\$335.00	Kasnitz
7/20/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend public meeting on EUS study development	2.5	\$670	\$1,675.00	Kasnitz
7/20/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Prep for meeting; review materials provided in advance	0.5	\$670	\$335.00	Kasnitz
7/30/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend call re: review of survey script	1	\$670	\$670.00	Kasnitz
8/6/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend meeting re: EUS development	2.5	\$670	\$1,675.00	Kasnitz
8/6/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Review study materials in advance of meeting	0.3	\$670	\$201.00	Kasnitz
10/13/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review SB 695 Report re: energy utility affordability for comments on scope and schedule of Phase 3	0.8	\$670	\$536.00	Kasnitz
10/13/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Review meeting notices & agendas re: EUS status	0.2	\$670	\$134.00	Kasnitz

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2021 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

10/19/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend Essential Use Study Update	1	\$670	\$670.00	Kasnitz
10/22/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Prep for Phase 3 PHC	0.3	\$670	\$201.00	Kasnitz
10/22/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend Phase 3 PHC	2	\$670	\$1,340.00	Kasnitz
11/5/2021	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review LBL Report re: Energy affordability and equity	0.7	\$670	\$469.00	Kasnitz
12/6/2021	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend update re: status of essential use study	0.9	\$670	\$603.00	Kasnitz
Totals 2021:				21.4		\$14,338.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2022 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
2/4/2022	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend meeting re: update on EUS	1.5	\$690	\$1,035.00	Kasnitz
2/8/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review materials for En Banc re: energy rates	0.4	\$690	\$276.00	Kasnitz
2/9/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Call w/ P. Goodman re: En Banc and key issues	0.2	\$690	\$138.00	Kasnitz
2/15/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Call w/ P. Goodman re: letter addressing need to include people with disabilities	0.2	\$690	\$138.00	Kasnitz
2/18/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Email exchange w/ Commission staff re: representation of disability issues at en banc	0.2	\$690	\$138.00	Kasnitz
2/18/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Prep for call re: participation in En Banc	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
2/18/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Call w/ Commission staff re: participation in energy rate en banc	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
2/24/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review updated agenda; call w/ O. Wein re: same & NCLC involvement	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
2/28/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend Affordability En Banc Day 1	7	\$690	\$4,830.00	Kasnitz
3/1/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend En Banc conference Day 2; participate in afternoon roundtable discussion	5	\$690	\$3,450.00	Kasnitz
3/4/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend EUS Stakeholder meeting re: qualitative interview findings	1.5	\$690	\$1,035.00	Kasnitz
3/31/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review slides in advance of working group meeting; call w/ P. Goodman re: same	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
4/22/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review materials in advance of call; email exchange w/ J. Dowdell (TURN) re: same	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
4/22/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend meeting re: survey on medical usage	1.3	\$690	\$897.00	Kasnitz

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2022 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

5/20/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review Ruling on Phase 3 steps following en banc; notes re: same	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
6/9/2022	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review ruling updating schedule; notes re: same	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
6/10/2022	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review ALJ Ruling re: proceedings of opportunity to comment on PD implementing the affordability metrics	0.2	\$690	\$138.00	Kasnitz
6/10/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend update call re: EUS	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
7/8/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend update on status of Essential Use Study	0.9	\$690	\$621.00	Kasnitz
7/20/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Outline Phase 3 Comments on ACR; call w/ P. Goodman re: same	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
7/27/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft comments re: public outreach efforts; call w/ P. Goodman re: same	2	\$690	\$1,380.00	Kasnitz
7/28/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft comments on Listening Sessions; call w/ P. Goodman re: same	2	\$690	\$1,380.00	Kasnitz
7/28/2022	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review Rev. 1 of PD implementing affordability metrics	0.4	\$690	\$276.00	Kasnitz
7/29/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft comments on Phase 3 Scoping Memo	1	\$690	\$690.00	Kasnitz
8/1/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Revise comments on listening sessions	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
8/1/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review party comments on Listening Sessions	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
9/9/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend call re: update on EUS (presentation of quantitative survey results)	1.1	\$690	\$759.00	Kasnitz
10/7/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend meeting re: web tool/EUS status	1.8	\$690	\$1,242.00	Kasnitz

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2022 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

10/12/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review Rulings re: Listening Sessions and community input; notes re: same & broad reach of issues	0.7	\$690	\$483.00	Kasnitz
10/12/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Conf. w/ K. Woodford re: community outreach on experiences w/ energy affordability and plan for support at upcoming listening sessions	0.4	\$690	\$276.00	Kasnitz
10/13/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review ruling requesting comments, 2020 Affordability Report & associated documents; notes re: same	1.5	\$690	\$1,035.00	Kasnitz
10/14/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review 2020 Affordability Report; notes re: same	0.7	\$690	\$483.00	Kasnitz
10/18/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft outline for comments on affordability report/affordability framework	1	\$690	\$690.00	Kasnitz
10/19/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft outline of comments on affordability framework	0.5	\$690	\$345.00	Kasnitz
11/22/2022	Affordability OIR	Study	Review information & agenda re: EUS Study Group Meeting	0.2	\$690	\$138.00	Kasnitz
11/23/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft comments on 2020 Affordability Report	2	\$690	\$1,380.00	Kasnitz
11/29/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Conf. w/ P. Goodman re: communications issues addressed in comments; email exchange re: same	0.3	\$690	\$207.00	Kasnitz
11/30/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft comments on 2020 Affordability Report	4.5	\$690	\$3,105.00	Kasnitz
11/30/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Brief review of party filings on 2020 Affordability Report	1	\$690	\$690.00	Kasnitz
12/9/2022	Affordability OIR	Study	Attend final meeting re: Essential Use Study & web tool (skipping between this and second meeting w/ conflicting time)	1.8	\$690	\$1,242.00	Kasnitz
Totals 2022:				45.6		\$31,464.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2023 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/11/2023	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review Cal Advocates emergency motion re: natural gas rates & motion to shorten time	0.2	\$715	\$143.00	Kasnitz
1/11/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Email exchange with P. Goodman about emergency motion re: natural gas rates & motion to shorten time	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz
1/12/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review procedural guidance re: responses to Cal Advocates emergency motion	0.2	\$715	\$143.00	Kasnitz
1/30/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review notice of en banc re: natural gas & electricity price increases	0.2	\$715	\$143.00	Kasnitz
2/7/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend Commission En Banc re: high natural gas prices and impact on electricity prices	4.2	\$715	\$3,003.00	Kasnitz
2/22/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review "Joint Ratepayer" recommendations	0.2	\$715	\$143.00	Kasnitz
3/2/2023	Affordability OIR	Study	Review draft Essential Usage Study; notes re: same for comment	0.7	\$715	\$500.50	Kasnitz
3/23/2023	Affordability OIR	Study	Review draft EUS Report & Cal Advocates comments re: same; email exchange w/ Cal Advocates	0.5	\$715	\$357.50	Kasnitz
5/19/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review 6th Amended Scoping Memo; notes re: same	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz
6/14/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review Cal Advocates Report on Broadband Pricing & focus paper on health impacts	0.7	\$715	\$500.50	Kasnitz
11/9/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend workshop on low-income programs (noticed in multiple dockets, only recorded here)	3	\$715	\$2,145.00	Kasnitz
12/14/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review ruling seeking feedback; notes re: same	0.3	\$715	\$214.50	Kasnitz
Totals 2023:				10.8		\$7,722.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2024 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/25/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Begin review of party opening comments on implementation ruling	0.5	\$735	\$367.50	Kasnitz
2/14/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Outline reply comments on energy and water	1	\$735	\$735.00	Kasnitz
2/16/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review & edit draft communications & water portions of comments on Implementation Ruling	1	\$735	\$735.00	Kasnitz
2/16/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft reply comments on implementation (Energy Issues)	2	\$735	\$1,470.00	Kasnitz
2/17/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review party reply comments on implementation	0.7	\$735	\$514.50	Kasnitz
7/30/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review ruling requiring cost and rate trackers from energy utilities and revising trackers from water utilities	0.3	\$735	\$220.50	Kasnitz
8/7/2024	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review ruling correcting error in July 30, 2024 ruling.	0.2	\$735	\$147.00	Kasnitz
Totals 2024:				5.7		\$4,189.50	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2025 Merits Time Melissa Kasnitz

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
11/13/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review PD revising framework & closing proceeding; notes re: same	0.5	\$755	\$377.50	Kasnitz
12/3/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review & edit draft comments on PD	0.4	\$755	\$302.00	Kasnitz
12/3/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review party comments on PD; notes re: same for reply	0.4	\$755	\$302.00	Kasnitz
12/8/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review party reply comments on PD	0.8	\$755	\$604.00	Kasnitz
12/16/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review Rev. 1 to PD closing proceeding;	0.2	\$755	\$151.00	Kasnitz
12/16/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Call w/ P. Goodman re: implications of removal of broadband speed issue and order for further review outside of open proceeding	0.3	\$755	\$226.50	Kasnitz
Totals 2025:				2.6		\$1,963.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2022 Merits Time Paul Goodman

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
2/15/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft letter to Commissioner Houck re: En Banc	1.6	\$550	\$880.00	Goodman
2/15/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Call w/ M. Kasnitz re: letter regarding panel	0.2	\$550	\$110.00	Goodman
3/1/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Attend Affordability Workshop (on-bill financing).	1	\$550	\$550.00	Goodman
4/1/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Prep for meeting re: essential usage rules tool	0.5	\$550	\$275.00	Goodman
4/1/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend videoconference re: Essential Use Study Web Tool	1.5	\$550	\$825.00	Goodman
4/22/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Attend Workshop on Essential Use of Electricity Study	1.5	\$550	\$825.00	Goodman
5/25/2022	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review ruling granting motions for party status of CLECA, Indicated Shippers, and EPUC	0.1	\$550	\$55.00	Goodman
6/9/2022	Affordability OIR	Procedural	Review ruling updating schedule; draft notes re: same.	0.2	\$550	\$110.00	Goodman
7/27/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Call w/ M. Kasnitz re: comments.	0.2	\$550	\$110.00	Goodman
8/10/2022	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Review Study on health impacts of shutoffs	1	\$550	\$550.00	Goodman
#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review ruling and affordability report; take notes re: same.	1.2	\$550	\$660.00	Goodman
#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review affordability study; draft notes for comments	0.9	\$550	\$495.00	Goodman
#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft comments	1	\$550	\$550.00	Goodman
#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft comments re: digital divide outcomes	1.8	\$550	\$990.00	Goodman

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2022 Merits Time Paul Goodman

#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Draft Comments	1.2	\$550	\$660.00	Goodman
#####	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review Opening Comments	1.2	\$550	\$660.00	Goodman
12/1/2022	Affordability OIR	ACR	Review Opening Comments	2.3	\$550	\$1,265.00	Goodman
Totals 2022:				17.4		\$9,570.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2023 Merits Time Paul Goodman

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
1/11/2023	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Email exchange with M. Kasnitz re: emergency motion re gas rates	0.3	\$575	\$172.50	Goodman
Totals 2023:				0.3		\$172.50	

Center for Accessible Technology
Affordability R.18-07-006
2024 Merits Time Paul Goodman

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
2/16/2024	Affordability OIR	Phase 3	Draft Affordability Comments.	3	\$625	\$1,875.00	Goodman
Totals 2024:				3		\$1,875.00	

Center for Accessible Technology
 Affordability R.18-07-006
 2025 Merits Time Paul Goodman

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
12/1/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Review PD and draft notes re: same.	0.8	\$680	\$544.00	Goodman
12/1/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Compile notes for comments on PD.	0.4	\$680	\$272.00	Goodman
12/2/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Draft Comments on PD	1.2	\$680	\$816.00	Goodman
12/3/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Draft Comments on PD	0.9	\$680	\$612.00	Goodman
12/8/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Draft Reply Comments on PD	1.8	\$680	\$1,224.00	Goodman
12/16/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Call w/M. Kasnitz re: broadband issues in PD	0.3	\$680	\$204.00	Goodman
12/17/2025	Affordability OIR	PD	Draft Letter from L. Singer to Commission re: broadband revisions	1.4	\$680	\$952.00	Goodman
Totals 2025:				6.8		\$4,624.00	

Center for Accessible Technology

Affordability R.18-07-006

Fee Time

Date	Proect	Task	Notes	Hours	Rate	Total	Name
2/9/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	0.2	\$137.50	\$27.50	Sweetnam
2/10/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	2.5	\$137.50	\$343.75	Sweetnam
2/11/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	1.2	\$137.50	\$165.00	Sweetnam
2/18/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	0.5	\$137.50	\$68.75	Sweetnam
2/19/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	5.2	\$137.50	\$715.00	Sweetnam
2/20/2026	Affordability	Fee Time	Prepare IComp claim.	5.1	\$137.50	\$701.25	Sweetnam
Total Fee Time:				14.7		\$2,021.25	